
THE PARABLES OF JESUS (KJV)

Jesus Explains to His Disciples Why He Uses Parables to Teach: 
Matthew 13
    10 The disciples came to him and asked, "Why do you speak to 
the people in parables?" 11 He replied, "The knowledge of the 
secrets of the kingdom of heaven has been given to you, but not to 
them. 12 Whoever has will be given more, and he will have an 
abundance. Whoever does not have, even what he has will be taken 
from him. 13 This is why I speak to them in parables: "Though 
seeing, they do not see; though hearing, they do not hear or 
understand. 14 In them is fulfilled the prophecy of Isaiah: "`You will 
be ever hearing but never understanding; you will be ever seeing but
never perceiving. 15 For this people's heart has become calloused; 
they hardly hear with their ears, and they have closed their eyes. 
Otherwise they might see with their eyes, hear with their ears, 
understand with their hearts and turn, and I would heal them.' 16 But 
blessed are your eyes because they see, and your ears because 
they hear. 17 For I tell you the truth, many prophets and righteous 
men longed to see what you see but did not see it, and to hear what 
you hear but did not hear it. 

     34 Jesus spoke all these things to the crowd in parables; he did 
not say anything to them without using a parable. 35 So was fulfilled 
what was spoken through the prophet: "I will open my mouth in 
parables, I will utter things hidden since the creation of the world." 

THE PARABLE OF THE SOWER (THE FARMER) Teaching 
illustrated: The Word of God falls on both good soil and bad soil.

Matthew 13:3-8 and 13:18-23  
    3 Then he told them many things in parables, saying: "A farmer 
went out to sow his seed. 4 As he was scattering the seed, some fell 
along the path, and the birds came and ate it up. 5 Some fell on 
rocky places, where it did not have much soil. It sprang up quickly, 
because the soil was shallow. 6 But when the sun came up, the 
plants were scorched, and they withered because they had no root. 7
Other seed fell among thorns, which grew up and choked the plants. 
8 Still other seed fell on good soil, where it produced a crop-- a 
hundred, sixty or thirty times what was sown. 

     18 "Listen then to what the parable of the sower means: 19 When
anyone hears the message about the kingdom and does not 
understand it, the evil one comes and snatches away what was sown
in his heart. This is the seed sown along the path. 20 The one who 
received the seed that fell on rocky places is the man who hears the 
word and at once receives it with joy. 21 But since he has no root, he
lasts only a short time. When trouble or persecution comes because 
of the word, he quickly falls away. 22 The one who received the seed
that fell among the thorns is the man who hears the word, but the 
worries of this life and the deceitfulness of wealth choke it, making it 
unfruitful. 23 But the one who received the seed that fell on good soil
is the man who hears the word and understands it. He produces a 
crop, yielding a hundred, sixty or thirty times what was sown." 



THE PARABLE OF THE WEEDS (TARES) Teaching illustrated: 
Satan Will Infiltrate the Church, God Will Separate

Matthew 13:24-30 and 13:36-43
    24 Jesus told them another parable: "The kingdom of heaven is 
like a man who sowed good seed in his field. 25 But while everyone 
was sleeping, his enemy came and sowed weeds among the wheat, 
and went away. 26 When the wheat sprouted and formed heads, 
then the weeds also appeared. 27 "The owner's servants came to 
him and said, `Sir, didn't you sow good seed in your field? Where 
then did the weeds come from?' 28 "`An enemy did this,' he replied. 
"The servants asked him, `Do you want us to go and pull them up?' 
29 "`No,' he answered, `because while you are pulling the weeds, 
you may root up the wheat with them. 30 Let both grow together until
the harvest. At that time I will tell the harvesters: First collect the 
weeds and tie them in bundles to be burned; then gather the wheat 
and bring it into my barn.'" 

     36 Then he left the crowd and went into the house. His disciples 
came to him and said, "Explain to us the parable of the weeds in the 
field." 37 He answered, "The one who sowed the good seed is the 
Son of Man. 38 The field is the world, and the good seed stands for 
the sons of the kingdom. The weeds are the sons of the evil one, 39 
and the enemy who sows them is the devil. The harvest is the end of 
the age, and the harvesters are angels. 40 "As the weeds are pulled 
up and burned in the fire, so it will be at the end of the age. 41 The 
Son of Man will send out his angels, and they will weed out of his 
kingdom everything that causes sin and all who do evil. 42 They will 
throw them into the fiery furnace, where there will be weeping and 
gnashing of teeth. 43 Then the righteous will shine like the sun in the 
kingdom of their Father. He who has ears, let him hear. 

THE PARABLE OF THE MUSTARD SEED Teaching illustrated: God 
Can Turn the Smallest Beginning Into Something Great

Matthew 13:31-32
    31 He told them another parable: "The kingdom of heaven is like a
mustard seed, which a man took and planted in his field. 32 Though 
it is the smallest of all your seeds, yet when it grows, it is the largest 
of garden plants and becomes a tree, so that the birds of the air 
come and perch in its branches." 

THE PARABLE OF YEAST Teaching illustrated: A Little Faith Will 
Grow and Increase the Kingdom

Matthew 13:33
    33 He told them still another parable: "The kingdom of heaven is 
like yeast that a woman took and mixed into a large amount of flour 
until it worked all through the dough." 

THE PARABLE OF THE HIDDEN TREASURE Teaching illustrated: 



Select Your "Treasure" in Life Carefully

Matthew 13:44
    44 "The kingdom of heaven is like treasure hidden in a field. When
a man found it, he hid it again, and then in his joy went and sold all 
he had and bought that field." 

THE PARABLE OF THE PEARL Teaching illustrated: Give Up 
Everything Else You Value in Life for God

Matthew 13:45-46
    45 "Again, the kingdom of heaven is like a merchant looking for 
fine pearls. 46 When he found one of great value, he went away and 
sold everything he had and bought it."

THE PARABLE OF THE NET Teaching illustrated: Separation of the 
Just and the Unjust

Matthew 13:47-50
    47 "Once again, the kingdom of heaven is like a net that was let 
down into the lake and caught all kinds of fish. 48 When it was full, 
the fishermen pulled it up on the shore. Then they sat down and 
collected the good fish in baskets, but threw the bad away. 49 This is
how it will be at the end of the age. The angels will come and 
separate the wicked from the righteous 50 and throw them into the 
fiery furnace, where there will be weeping and gnashing of teeth. 

THE PARABLE OF THE WORKERS IN THE VINEYARD Teaching 
illustrated: Rewards for the Faithful and the Unfaithful

Matthew 20:1-16  
    1 "For the kingdom of heaven is like a landowner who went out 
early in the morning to hire men to work in his vineyard. 2 He agreed 
to pay them a denarius for the day and sent them into his vineyard. 

     3 "About the third hour he went out and saw others standing in 
the marketplace doing nothing. 4 He told them, `You also go and 
work in my vineyard, and I will pay you whatever is right.' 5 So they 
went. 

       "He went out again about the sixth hour and the ninth hour and 
did the same thing. 6 About the eleventh hour he went out and found 
still others standing around. He asked them, `Why have you been 
standing here all day long doing nothing?' 

     7 "`Because no one has hired us,' they answered. 

       "He said to them, `You also go and work in my vineyard.' 

     8 "When evening came, the owner of the vineyard said to his 
foreman, `Call the workers and pay them their wages, beginning with
the last ones hired and going on to the first.' 



     9 "The workers who were hired about the eleventh hour came and
each received a denarius. 10 So when those came who were hired 
first, they expected to receive more. But each one of them also 
received a denarius. 11 When they received it, they began to 
grumble against the landowner. 12 `These men who were hired last 
worked only one hour,' they said, `and you have made them equal to 
us who have borne the burden of the work and the heat of the day.' 

     13 "But he answered one of them, `Friend, I am not being unfair 
to you. Didn't you agree to work for a denarius? 14 Take your pay 
and go. I want to give the man who was hired last the same as I 
gave you. 15 Don't I have the right to do what I want with my own 
money? Or are you envious because I am generous?' 

     16 "So the last will be first, and the first will be last." 

THE PARABLE OF TWO SONS Teaching illustrated: No One is 
Beneath God's Redeeming Love

Matthew 21:28-32  
    28 "What do you think? There was a man who had two sons. He 
went to the first and said, `Son, go and work today in the vineyard.' 
29 "`I will not,' he answered, but later he changed his mind and went.
30 "Then the father went to the other son and said the same thing. 
He answered, `I will, sir,' but he did not go. 31 "Which of the two did 
what his father wanted?" "The first," they answered. Jesus said to 
them, "I tell you the truth, the tax collectors and the prostitutes are 
entering the kingdom of God ahead of you. 32 For John came to you 
to show you the way of righteousness, and you did not believe him, 
but the tax collectors and the prostitutes did. And even after you saw 
this, you did not repent and believe him. 

THE PARABLE OF THE EVIL RENTERS Teaching illustrated: Those
Guilty of Martyring the Saints Will Be Destroyed

Matthew 21:33-41
    33 "Listen to another parable: There was a landowner who planted
a vineyard. He put a wall around it, dug a winepress in it and built a 
watchtower. Then he rented the vineyard to some farmers and went 
away on a journey. 34 When the harvest time approached, he sent 
his servants to the tenants to collect his fruit. 

     35 "The tenants seized his servants; they beat one, killed another,
and stoned a third. 36 Then he sent other servants to them, more 
than the first time, and the tenants treated them the same way. 37 
Last of all, he sent his son to them. `They will respect my son,' he 
said. 

     38 "But when the tenants saw the son, they said to each other, 
`This is the heir. Come, let's kill him and take his inheritance.' 39 So 
they took him and threw him out of the vineyard and killed him. 

     40 "Therefore, when the owner of the vineyard comes, what will 



he do to those tenants?" 

     41 "He will bring those wretches to a wretched end," they replied, 
"and he will rent the vineyard to other tenants, who will give him his 
share of the crop at harvest time." 

THE PARABLE OF THE WEDDING DINNER Teaching illustrated: 
Failure to Accept God's Invitation Will Result in Death
                     Also That Israel Will Be Punished For Rejecting 
Messiah

Matthew 22:1-14  
    1 Jesus spoke to them again in parables, saying: 2 "The kingdom 
of heaven is like a king who prepared a wedding banquet for his son.
3 He sent his servants to those who had been invited to the banquet 
to tell them to come, but they refused to come. 

     4 "Then he sent some more servants and said, `Tell those who 
have been invited that I have prepared my dinner: My oxen and 
fattened cattle have been butchered, and everything is ready. Come 
to the wedding banquet.' 

     5 "But they paid no attention and went off-- one to his field, 
another to his business. 6 The rest seized his servants, mistreated 
them and killed them. 7 The king was enraged. He sent his army and
destroyed those murderers and burned their city. 

     8 "Then he said to his servants, `The wedding banquet is ready, 
but those I invited did not deserve to come. 9 Go to the street 
corners and invite to the banquet anyone you find.' 10 So the 
servants went out into the streets and gathered all the people they 
could find, both good and bad, and the wedding hall was filled with 
guests. 

     11 "But when the king came in to see the guests, he noticed a 
man there who was not wearing wedding clothes. 12 `Friend,' he 
asked, `how did you get in here without wedding clothes?' The man 
was speechless. 

     13 "Then the king told the attendants, `Tie him hand and foot, and
throw him outside, into the darkness, where there will be weeping 
and gnashing of teeth.' 

     14 "For many are invited, but few are chosen." 

THE PARABLE OF THE TEN VIRGINS Teaching illustrated: Be 
Ready For the Return of The Bridegroom (Jesus)

Matthew 25:1-13  
    1 "At that time the kingdom of heaven will be like ten virgins who 
took their lamps and went out to meet the bridegroom. 2 Five of them
were foolish and five were wise. 3 The foolish ones took their lamps 
but did not take any oil with them. 4 The wise, however, took oil in 
jars along with their lamps. 5 The bridegroom was a long time in 



coming, and they all became drowsy and fell asleep. 

     6 "At midnight the cry rang out: `Here's the bridegroom! Come out
to meet him!' 

     7 "Then all the virgins woke up and trimmed their lamps. 8 The 
foolish ones said to the wise, `Give us some of your oil; our lamps 
are going out.' 

     9 "`No,' they replied, `there may not be enough for both us and 
you. Instead, go to those who sell oil and buy some for yourselves.' 

     10 "But while they were on their way to buy the oil, the 
bridegroom arrived. The virgins who were ready went in with him to 
the wedding banquet. And the door was shut. 

     11 "Later the others also came. `Sir! Sir!' they said. `Open the 
door for us!' 

     12 "But he replied, `I tell you the truth, I don't know you.' 

     13 "Therefore keep watch, because you do not know the day or 
the hour. 

THE PARABLE OF THE TALENTS Teaching illustrated: God Wants 
Us to Use Our Talents Fully

Matthew 25:14-30
    14 "Again, it will be like a man going on a journey, who called his 
servants and entrusted his property to them. 15 To one he gave five 
talents of money, to another two talents, and to another one talent, 
each according to his ability. Then he went on his journey. 16 The 
man who had received the five talents went at once and put his 
money to work and gained five more. 17 So also, the one with the 
two talents gained two more. 18 But the man who had received the 
one talent went off, dug a hole in the ground and hid his master's 
money. 

     19 "After a long time the master of those servants returned and 
settled accounts with them. 20 The man who had received the five 
talents brought the other five. `Master,' he said, `you entrusted me 
with five talents. See, I have gained five more.' 21 "His master 
replied, `Well done, good and faithful servant! You have been faithful 
with a few things; I will put you in charge of many things. Come and 
share your master's happiness!' 

     22 "The man with the two talents also came. `Master,' he said, 
`you entrusted me with two talents; see, I have gained two more.' 

     23 "His master replied, `Well done, good and faithful servant! You 
have been faithful with a few things; I will put you in charge of many 
things. Come and share your master's happiness!' 

     24 "Then the man who had received the one talent came. 
`Master,' he said, `I knew that you are a hard man, harvesting where 



you have not sown and gathering where you have not scattered 
seed. 25 So I was afraid and went out and hid your talent in the 
ground. See, here is what belongs to you.' 

     26 "His master replied, `You wicked, lazy servant! So you knew 
that I harvest where I have not sown and gather where I have not 
scattered seed? 27 Well then, you should have put my money on 
deposit with the bankers, so that when I returned I would have 
received it back with interest. 

     28 "`Take the talent from him and give it to the one who has the 
ten talents. 29 For everyone who has will be given more, and he will 
have an abundance. Whoever does not have, even what he has will 
be taken from him. 30 And throw that worthless servant outside, into 
the darkness, where there will be weeping and gnashing of teeth.' 

THE PARABLE OF THE LOST SHEEP Teaching illustrated: Every 
Person is Valuable to God

Matthew 18:12-14  
    12 "What do you think? If a man owns a hundred sheep, and one 
of them wanders away, will he not leave the ninety-nine on the hills 
and go to look for the one that wandered off? 13 And if he finds it, I 
tell you the truth, he is happier about that one sheep than about the 
ninety-nine that did not wander off. 14 In the same way your Father 
in heaven is not willing that any of these little ones should be lost. 

THE PARABLE OF THE UNFORGIVING SERVANT Teaching 
illustrated: Forgive Others Just As God Has Forgiven Your Sins

Matthew 18:23-35
    23 "Therefore, the kingdom of heaven is like a king who wanted to 
settle accounts with his servants. 24 As he began the settlement, a 
man who owed him ten thousand talents was brought to him. 25 
Since he was not able to pay, the master ordered that he and his wife
and his children and all that he had be sold to repay the debt. 

     26 "The servant fell on his knees before him. `Be patient with me,'
he begged, `and I will pay back everything.' 27 The servant's master 
took pity on him, canceled the debt and let him go. 

     28 "But when that servant went out, he found one of his fellow 
servants who owed him a hundred denarii. He grabbed him and 
began to choke him. `Pay back what you owe me!' he demanded. 

     29 "His fellow servant fell to his knees and begged him, `Be 
patient with me, and I will pay you back.' 

     30 "But he refused. Instead, he went off and had the man thrown 
into prison until he could pay the debt. 31 When the other servants 
saw what had happened, they were greatly distressed and went and 
told their master everything that had happened. 

     32 "Then the master called the servant in. `You wicked servant,' 



he said, `I canceled all that debt of yours because you begged me to.
33 Shouldn't you have had mercy on your fellow servant just as I had
on you?' 34 In anger his master turned him over to the jailers to be 
tortured, until he should pay back all he owed. 

     35 "This is how my heavenly Father will treat each of you unless 
you forgive your brother from your heart."  

THE PARABLE OF THE OLD AND NEW WINEBAGS Teaching 
illustrated: 

Matthew 9:16-17  
    16 "No one sews a patch of unshrunk cloth on an old garment, for 
the patch will pull away from the garment, making the tear worse. 17 
Neither do men pour new wine into old wineskins. If they do, the 
skins will burst, the wine will run out and the wineskins will be ruined.
No, they pour new wine into new wineskins, and both are preserved."

THE PARABLE OF THE WISE AND FAITHFUL SERVANTS 
Teaching illustrated: While We Wait for Jesus to Return We Are to 
Work 

Matthew 24:45-51  
    45 "Who then is the faithful and wise servant, whom the master 
has put in charge of the servants in his household to give them their 
food at the proper time? 46 It will be good for that servant whose 
master finds him doing so when he returns. 47 I tell you the truth, he 
will put him in charge of all his possessions. 48 But suppose that 
servant is wicked and says to himself, `My master is staying away a 
long time,' 49 and he then begins to beat his fellow servants and to 
eat and drink with drunkards. 50 The master of that servant will come
on a day when he does not expect him and at an hour he is not 
aware of. 51 He will cut him to pieces and assign him a place with 
the hypocrites, where there will be weeping and gnashing of teeth. 

THE PARABLE OF THE GOOD SAMARITAN Teaching illustrated: 
Help Others in Need

Luke 10:30-37
    30 In reply Jesus said: "A man was going down from Jerusalem to 
Jericho, when he fell into the hands of robbers. They stripped him of 
his clothes, beat him and went away, leaving him half dead. 31 A 
priest happened to be going down the same road, and when he saw 
the man, he passed by on the other side. 32 So too, a Levite, when 
he came to the place and saw him, passed by on the other side. 33 
But a Samaritan, as he traveled, came where the man was; and 
when he saw him, he took pity on him. 34 He went to him and 
bandaged his wounds, pouring on oil and wine. Then he put the man 
on his own donkey, took him to an inn and took care of him. 35 The 
next day he took out two silver coins and gave them to the 
innkeeper. `Look after him,' he said, `and when I return, I will 



reimburse you for any extra expense you may have.' 

     36 "Which of these three do you think was a neighbor to the man 
who fell into the hands of robbers?" 

     37 The expert in the law replied, "The one who had mercy on 
him." 

        Jesus told him, "Go and do likewise." 

THE PARABLE OF THE FRIEND IN NEED AT MIDNIGHT Teaching 
illustrated: Be Persistent in Prayer, God Will Answer 

Luke 11:5-13  
    5 Then he said to them, "Suppose one of you has a friend, and he 
goes to him at midnight and says, `Friend, lend me three loaves of 
bread, 6 because a friend of mine on a journey has come to me, and 
I have nothing to set before him.' 

     7 "Then the one inside answers, `Don't bother me. The door is 
already locked, and my children are with me in bed. I can't get up 
and give you anything.' 8 I tell you, though he will not get up and give
him the bread because he is his friend, yet because of the man's 
boldness he will get up and give him as much as he needs. 

     9 "So I say to you: Ask and it will be given to you; seek and you 
will find; knock and the door will be opened to you. 10 For everyone 
who asks receives; he who seeks finds; and to him who knocks, the 
door will be opened. 

     11 "Which of you fathers, if your son asks for a fish, will give him a
snake instead? 12 Or if he asks for an egg, will give him a scorpion? 
13 If you then, though you are evil, know how to give good gifts to 
your children, how much more will your Father in heaven give the 
Holy Spirit to those who ask him!" 

THE PARABLE OF THE RICH FOOL Teaching illustrated:

Luke 12:16-34
    16 And he told them this parable: "The ground of a certain rich 
man produced a good crop. 17 He thought to himself, `What shall I 
do? I have no place to store my crops.' 

     18 "Then he said, `This is what I'll do. I will tear down my barns 
and build bigger ones, and there I will store all my grain and my 
goods. 19 And I'll say to myself, "You have plenty of good things laid 
up for many years. Take life easy; eat, drink and be merry." ' 

     20 "But God said to him, `You fool! This very night your life will be 
demanded from you. Then who will get what you have prepared for 
yourself?' 

     21 "This is how it will be with anyone who stores up things for 
himself but is not rich toward God." 



     22 Then Jesus said to his disciples: "Therefore I tell you, do not 
worry about your life, what you will eat; or about your body, what you 
will wear. 23 Life is more than food, and the body more than clothes. 
24 Consider the ravens: They do not sow or reap, they have no 
storeroom or barn; yet God feeds them. And how much more 
valuable you are than birds! 25 Who of you by worrying can add a 
single hour to his life? 26 Since you cannot do this very little thing, 
why do you worry about the rest? 

     27 "Consider how the lilies grow. They do not labor or spin. Yet I 
tell you, not even Solomon in all his splendor was dressed like one of
these. 28 If that is how God clothes the grass of the field, which is 
here today, and tomorrow is thrown into the fire, how much more will 
he clothe you, O you of little faith! 29 And do not set your heart on 
what you will eat or drink; do not worry about it. 30 For the pagan 
world runs after all such things, and your Father knows that you need
them. 31 But seek his kingdom, and these things will be given to you 
as well. 

     32 "Do not be afraid, little flock, for your Father has been pleased 
to give you the kingdom. 33 Sell your possessions and give to the 
poor. Provide purses for yourselves that will not wear out, a treasure 
in heaven that will not be exhausted, where no thief comes near and 
no moth destroys. 34 For where your treasure is, there your heart will
be also. 

THE FIG TREE WITHOUT FRUIT Teaching illustrated: You Will Be 
Cut Off If You Don't Bear Fruit For Jesus

Luke 13:6-9  
    6 Then he told this parable: "A man had a fig tree, planted in his 
vineyard, and he went to look for fruit on it, but did not find any. 7 So 
he said to the man who took care of the vineyard, `For three years 
now I've been coming to look for fruit on this fig tree and haven't 
found any. Cut it down! Why should it use up the soil?' 8 "`Sir,' the 
man replied, `leave it alone for one more year, and I'll dig around it 
and fertilize it. 9 If it bears fruit next year, fine! If not, then cut it 
down.'" 

THE PARABLE OF THE WEDDING DINNER Teaching illustrated: 
God Will Exalt His Humble Servants 

Luke 14:7-11  
    7 When he noticed how the guests picked the places of honor at 
the table, he told them this parable: 8 "When someone invites you to 
a wedding feast, do not take the place of honor, for a person more 
distinguished than you may have been invited. 9 If so, the host who 
invited both of you will come and say to you, `Give this man your 
seat.' Then, humiliated, you will have to take the least important 
place. 10 But when you are invited, take the lowest place, so that 
when your host comes, he will say to you, `Friend, move up to a 
better place.' Then you will be honored in the presence of all your 
fellow guests. 11 For everyone who exalts himself will be humbled, 



and he who humbles himself will be exalted." 

THE PARABLE OF THE LOST COIN Teaching illustrated: God is 
Pleased When One Sinner Repents of His Sin

Luke 15:8-10  
    8 "Or suppose a woman has ten silver coins and loses one. Does 
she not light a lamp, sweep the house and search carefully until she 
finds it? 9 And when she finds it, she calls her friends and neighbors 
together and says, `Rejoice with me; I have found my lost coin.' 10 In
the same way, I tell you, there is rejoicing in the presence of the 
angels of God over one sinner who repents." 

THE PARABLE OF THE LOST SON Teaching illustrated: Everyone 
Who Returns Home to God Will Be Saved

Luke 15:11-32
    11 Jesus continued: "There was a man who had two sons. 12 The 
younger one said to his father, `Father, give me my share of the 
estate.' So he divided his property between them. 

     13 "Not long after that, the younger son got together all he had, 
set off for a distant country and there squandered his wealth in wild 
living. 14 After he had spent everything, there was a severe famine in
that whole country, and he began to be in need. 15 So he went and 
hired himself out to a citizen of that country, who sent him to his 
fields to feed pigs. 16 He longed to fill his stomach with the pods that
the pigs were eating, but no one gave him anything. 

     17 "When he came to his senses, he said, `How many of my 
father's hired men have food to spare, and here I am starving to 
death! 18 I will set out and go back to my father and say to him: 
Father, I have sinned against heaven and against you. 19 I am no 
longer worthy to be called your son; make me like one of your hired 
men.' 20 So he got up and went to his father. 

        "But while he was still a long way off, his father saw him and 
was filled with compassion for him; he ran to his son, threw his arms 
around him and kissed him. 

     21 "The son said to him, `Father, I have sinned against heaven 
and against you. I am no longer worthy to be called your son.' 

     22 "But the father said to his servants, `Quick! Bring the best robe
and put it on him. Put a ring on his finger and sandals on his feet. 23 
Bring the fattened calf and kill it. Let's have a feast and celebrate. 24 
For this son of mine was dead and is alive again; he was lost and is 
found.' So they began to celebrate. 

     25 "Meanwhile, the older son was in the field. When he came 
near the house, he heard music and dancing. 26 So he called one of 
the servants and asked him what was going on. 27 `Your brother has
come,' he replied, `and your father has killed the fattened calf 
because he has him back safe and sound.' 



     28 "The older brother became angry and refused to go in. So his 
father went out and pleaded with him. 29 But he answered his father,
`Look! All these years I've been slaving for you and never disobeyed 
your orders. Yet you never gave me even a young goat so I could 
celebrate with my friends. 30 But when this son of yours who has 
squandered your property with prostitutes comes home, you kill the 
fattened calf for him!' 

     31 "`My son,' the father said, `you are always with me, and 
everything I have is yours. 32 But we had to celebrate and be glad, 
because this brother of yours was dead and is alive again; he was 
lost and is found.'"  

THE PARABLE OF THE SHREWD MANAGER Teaching illustrated: 
Be a Good Steward of God's Money, Use it for His Will

Luke 16:1-10  
    1 Jesus told his disciples: "There was a rich man whose manager 
was accused of wasting his possessions. 2 So he called him in and 
asked him, `What is this I hear about you? Give an account of your 
management, because you cannot be manager any longer.' 

     3 "The manager said to himself, `What shall I do now? My master 
is taking away my job. I'm not strong enough to dig, and I'm 
ashamed to beg-- 4 I know what I'll do so that, when I lose my job 
here, people will welcome me into their houses.' 

     5 "So he called in each one of his master's debtors. He asked the 
first, `How much do you owe my master?' 

     6 "`Eight hundred gallons of olive oil,' he replied. 

       "The manager told him, `Take your bill, sit down quickly, and 
make it four hundred.' 

     7 "Then he asked the second, `And how much do you owe?' 

       "`A thousand bushels of wheat,' he replied. 

       "He told him, `Take your bill and make it eight hundred.' 

     8 "The master commended the dishonest manager because he 
had acted shrewdly. For the people of this world are more shrewd in 
dealing with their own kind than are the people of the light. 9 I tell 
you, use worldly wealth to gain friends for yourselves, so that when it
is gone, you will be welcomed into eternal dwellings. 

     10 "Whoever can be trusted with very little can also be trusted 
with much, and whoever is dishonest with very little will also be 
dishonest with much. 11 So if you have not been trustworthy in 
handling worldly wealth, who will trust you with true riches? 12 And if 
you have not been trustworthy with someone else's property, who will
give you property of your own? 



THE STORY OF THE RICH MAN AND LAZARUS Teaching 
illustrated: The Wealth of This World is Very Temporary

Luke 16:19-31
    19 "There was a rich man who was dressed in purple and fine 
linen and lived in luxury every day. 20 At his gate was laid a beggar 
named Lazarus, covered with sores 21 and longing to eat what fell 
from the rich man's table. Even the dogs came and licked his sores. 

     22 "The time came when the beggar died and the angels carried 
him to Abraham's side. The rich man also died and was buried. 23 In 
hell, where he was in torment, he looked up and saw Abraham far 
away, with Lazarus by his side. 24 So he called to him, `Father 
Abraham, have pity on me and send Lazarus to dip the tip of his 
finger in water and cool my tongue, because I am in agony in this 
fire.' 

     25 "But Abraham replied, `Son, remember that in your lifetime you
received your good things, while Lazarus received bad things, but 
now he is comforted here and you are in agony. 26 And besides all 
this, between us and you a great chasm has been fixed, so that 
those who want to go from here to you cannot, nor can anyone cross
over from there to us.' 

     27 "He answered, `Then I beg you, father, send Lazarus to my 
father's house, 28 for I have five brothers. Let him warn them, so that
they will not also come to this place of torment.' 

     29 "Abraham replied, `They have Moses and the Prophets; let 
them listen to them.' 30 "`No, father Abraham,' he said, `but if 
someone from the dead goes to them, they will repent.' 

     31 "He said to him, `If they do not listen to Moses and the 
Prophets, they will not be convinced even if someone rises from the 
dead.'"  

THE PARABLE OF THE UNCARING JUDGE Teaching illustrated: 
God Will Protect His People

Luke 18:1-8  
    1 Then Jesus told his disciples a parable to show them that they 
should always pray and not give up. 2 He said: "In a certain town 
there was a judge who neither feared God nor cared about men. 3 
And there was a widow in that town who kept coming to him with the 
plea, `Grant me justice against my adversary.' 

     4 "For some time he refused. But finally he said to himself, `Even 
though I don't fear God or care about men, 5 yet because this widow 
keeps bothering me, I will see that she gets justice, so that she won't 
eventually wear me out with her coming!'" 

     6 And the Lord said, "Listen to what the unjust judge says. 7 And 
will not God bring about justice for his chosen ones, who cry out to 
him day and night? Will he keep putting them off? 8 I tell you, he will 



see that they get justice, and quickly. However, when the Son of Man
comes, will he find faith on the earth?" 

THE PARABLE OF THE PHARISEE AND THE TAX COLLECTOR 
Teaching illustrated: God Came to Save Sinners Not Religious 
People

Luke 18:9-14
    9 To some who were confident of their own righteousness and 
looked down on everybody else, Jesus told this parable: 10 "Two 
men went up to the temple to pray, one a Pharisee and the other a 
tax collector. 11 The Pharisee stood up and prayed about himself: 
`God, I thank you that I am not like other men-- robbers, evildoers, 
adulterers-- or even like this tax collector. 12 I fast twice a week and 
give a tenth of all I get.' 

     13 "But the tax collector stood at a distance. He would not even 
look up to heaven, but beat his breast and said, `God, have mercy 
on me, a sinner.' 

     14 "I tell you that this man, rather than the other, went home 
justified before God. For everyone who exalts himself will be 
humbled, and he who humbles himself will be exalted." 

JESUS TEACHES ABOUT THE KINGDOM OF GOD AND THE 
FAITH OF A LITTLE CHILD Teaching illustrated: Little Children are 
Very Important to God

Luke 18:15-17
    15 People were also bringing babies to Jesus to have him touch 
them. When the disciples saw this, they rebuked them. 16 But Jesus 
called the children to him and said, "Let the little children come to 
me, and do not hinder them, for the kingdom of God belongs to such 
as these. 17 I tell you the truth, anyone who will not receive the 
kingdom of God like a little child will never enter it." 

THE PARABLE OF THE WAGES (TEN MINAS) Teaching illustrated: 
The Principal of Good Stewardship is Taught

Luke 19:11-27
    11 While they were listening to this, he went on to tell them a 
parable, because he was near Jerusalem and the people thought 
that the kingdom of God was going to appear at once. 12 He said: "A
man of noble birth went to a distant country to have himself 
appointed king and then to return. 13 So he called ten of his servants
and gave them ten minas. `Put this money to work,' he said, `until I 
come back.' 

     14 "But his subjects hated him and sent a delegation after him to 
say, `We don't want this man to be our king.' 

     15 "He was made king, however, and returned home. Then he 
sent for the servants to whom he had given the money, in order to 



find out what they had gained with it. 

     16 "The first one came and said, `Sir, your mina has earned ten 
more.' 

     17 "`Well done, my good servant!' his master replied. `Because 
you have been trustworthy in a very small matter, take charge of ten 
cities.' 

     18 "The second came and said, `Sir, your mina has earned five 
more.' 

     19 "His master answered, `You take charge of five cities.' 

     20 "Then another servant came and said, `Sir, here is your mina; I
have kept it laid away in a piece of cloth. 21 I was afraid of you, 
because you are a hard man. You take out what you did not put in 
and reap what you did not sow.' 

     22 "His master replied, `I will judge you by your own words, you 
wicked servant! You knew, did you, that I am a hard man, taking out 
what I did not put in, and reaping what I did not sow? 23 Why then 
didn't you put my money on deposit, so that when I came back, I 
could have collected it with interest?' 

     24 "Then he said to those standing by, `Take his mina away from 
him and give it to the one who has ten minas.' 

     25 "`Sir,' they said, `he already has ten!' 

     26 "He replied, `I tell you that to everyone who has, more will be 
given, but as for the one who has nothing, even what he has will be 
taken away. 27 But those enemies of mine who did not want me to 
be king over them-- bring them here and kill them in front of me.'"


